
Blog Post for January 10, 2024

A List of Biblical Blessings To Pray Over Others.

On December 31, 2023 I taught on ‘The Blessing of God’ from Number 6:24-26. It is 
probably the most famous biblical blessing. But there are many others in the Scripture. 
We periodically use each of these different blessings as the benediction/blessing at the 
end of our meeting. I am giving them here as a guide you can print as your pray or 
speak these over others. You can also use them as a guide in  praying for your own 
needs before the Lord.

In Christ,

Bret



Genesis 12:2-3 

I will make you into a great nation and I will bless you; I will make your name great, and 
you will be a blessing. 3 I will bless those who bless you, and whoever curses you I will 
curse; and all peoples on earth will be blessed through you.


Genesis 27:28

May God give you of heaven’s dew and of earth’s richness — an abundance of grain 
and new wine. 


(From Genesis 27:28; Deuteronomy 33:15-16)

May God give you of heaven’s dew and of earth’s richness — an abundance of grain 
and new wine, with the choicest gifts of the ancient mountains and the fruitfulness of the 
everlasting hills; with the best gifts of the earth and the favor of our Lord, until you sit at 
His Wedding Feast on the final day!


Deuteronomy 1:11

May the LORD, the God of your fathers, increase you a thousand times and bless you 
as he has promised!


Numbers 6:24-26

The LORD bless you and keep you; 25 the LORD make his face shine upon you and be 
gracious to you; 26 the LORD turn his face toward you and give you peace.


Psalm 20:1-5

May the LORD answer you when you are in distress; may the name of the God of Jacob 
protect you. 2 May he send you help from the sanctuary and grant you support from 
Zion. 3 May he remember all your sacrifices and accept your burnt offerings. Selah 4 May 
he give you the desire of your heart and make all your plans succeed. 5 We will shout for 
joy when you are victorious and will lift up our banners in the name of our God. May the 
LORD grant all your requests. 


Psalms 29:11

May the Lord give strength to his people; may the Lord bless his people with peace. 




Psalm 67

May God be gracious to us and bless us and make his face shine upon us, Selah 2 that 
your ways may be known on earth, your salvation among all nations. 3 May the peoples 
praise you, O God; may all the peoples praise you. 4 May the nations be glad and sing 
for joy, for you rule the peoples justly and guide the nations of the earth. Selah 5 May the 
peoples praise you, O God; may all the peoples praise you. 6 Then the land will yield its 
harvest, and God, our God, will bless us. 7 God will bless us, and all the ends of the 
earth will fear him.


Psalm 79:9

Help us, O God our Savior, for the glory of your name; deliver us and forgive our sins for 
your name's sake.


Psalms 90:16–17

May your deeds be shown to your servants, your splendor to their children. 17 May the 
favor of the Lord our God rest upon us; establish the work of our hands for us — yes, 
establish the work of our hands. 


Palm 104:31

May the glory of the LORD endure forever; may the LORD rejoice in his works— 


Psalm 115:14-15

May the LORD make you increase, both you and your children. 15 May you be blessed 
by the LORD, the Maker of heaven and earth.


Psalms 121:7–8

The Lord will keep you from all harm — he will watch over your life; 8 the Lord will watch 
over your coming and going both now and forevermore. 


Psalm 128:5-6

May the LORD bless you from Zion all the days of your life; may you see the prosperity 
of Jerusalem, 6 and may you live to see your children's children. Peace be upon Israel.


Psalm 134:3

May the LORD, the Maker of heaven and earth, bless you from Zion.




Acts 20:32 

Now I commit you to God and to the word of his grace, which can build you up and give 
you an inheritance among all those who are sanctified.


Romans 15:5-6

May the God who gives endurance and encouragement give you a spirit of unity among 
yourselves as you follow Christ Jesus, 6 so that with one heart and mouth you may 
glorify the God and Father of our Lord Jesus Christ. 


Romans 15:13

May the God of hope fill you with all joy and peace as you trust in him, so that you may 
overflow with hope by the power of the Holy Spirit.


Romans 15:33

The God of peace be with you all. Amen. 


1 Corinthians 15:58

Therefore, my dear brothers and sisters, stand firm. Let nothing move you. Always give 
yourselves fully to the work of the Lord, because you know that your labor in the Lord is 
not in vain. May God fill your hearts with joy as you labor for Him. 


2 Corinthians 9:8

May God make all grace abound to you, so that in all things at all times, having all that 
you need, you will abound in every good work. 


2 Corinthians 13:14

May the grace of the Lord Jesus Christ, and the love of God, and the fellowship of the 
Holy Spirit be with you all.


Galatians 6:18

The grace of our Lord Jesus Christ be with your spirit, brothers. Amen. 




Ephesians 1:17–19

May the God of our Lord Jesus Christ, the glorious Father, give you the Spirit of wisdom 
and revelation, 18 so that you may know him better having the eyes of your heart 
enlightened in order that you may know the hope to which he has called you, the riches 
of his glorious inheritance in the saints, 19 and his incomparably great power for us who 
believe. 


Ephesians 3:20–21

Now to him who is able to do immeasurably more than all we ask or imagine, according 
to his power that is at work within us, 21 to him be glory in the church and in Christ Jesus 
throughout all generations, for ever and ever! Amen. 


Ephesians 6:23–24

Peace to the brothers, and love with faith from God the Father and the Lord Jesus 
Christ. 24 Grace to all who love our Lord Jesus Christ with an undying love.


Philippians 1:2

Grace and peace to you from God our Father and the Lord Jesus Christ.


Philippians 3:10–11

May you know Christ and the power of his resurrection and the fellowship of sharing in 
his sufferings, becoming like him in his death, and attaining eternal life and the 
resurrection from the dead.


Philippians 4:7

And the peace of God, which transcends all understanding, will guard your hearts and 
your minds in Christ Jesus. 


Philippians 4:19–20 

May God meet all your needs according to his glorious riches in Christ Jesus. 20 To our 
God and Father be glory for ever and ever. Amen. 


Philippians 4:23

The grace of the Lord Jesus Christ be with your spirit. Amen.


Colossians 3:15

Let the peace of Christ rule in your hearts, since as members of one body you were 
called to peace. And be thankful. 




1 Thessalonians 3:12-13

May the Lord make your love increase and overflow for each other and for everyone 
else, just as ours does for you. 13 May he strengthen your hearts so that you will be 
blameless and holy in the presence of our God and Father when our Lord Jesus comes 
with all his holy ones. 


1 Thessalonians 5:23-24, 28

May God himself, the God of peace, sanctify you through and through. May your whole 
spirit, soul and body be kept blameless at the coming of our Lord Jesus Christ. 24 The 
one who calls you is faithful and he will do it… 28 The grace of our Lord Jesus Christ be 
with you.


2 Thessalonians 2:16–17

May our Lord Jesus Christ himself and God our Father, who loved us and by his grace 
gave us eternal encouragement and good hope, 17 encourage your hearts and 
strengthen you in every good deed and word. 


2 Thessalonians 3:5

May the Lord direct your hearts into God's love and Christ's perseverance. 


2 Thessalonians 3:16

Now may the Lord of peace himself give you peace at all times and in every way. The 
Lord be with all of you.


1 Timothy 1:17

Now to the King eternal, immortal, invisible, the only God, be honor and glory for ever 
and ever. Amen.


1 Timothy 6:15-16

God, the blessed and only Ruler, the King of kings and Lord of lords, 16 who alone is 
immortal and who lives in unapproachable light, whom no one has seen or can see. To 
him be honor and might forever. Amen.


2 Timothy 1:2

Grace, mercy and peace from God the Father and Christ Jesus our Lord. 




Philemon 1:25 

The grace of the Lord Jesus Christ be with your spirit. 


Hebrews 13:20-21

May the God of peace, who through the blood of the eternal covenant brought back 
from the dead our Lord Jesus, that great Shepherd of the sheep, 21 equip you with 
everything good for doing his will, and may he work in us what is pleasing to him, 
through Jesus Christ, to whom be glory for ever and ever. Amen. 


Hebrews 13:25

Grace be with you all. 


1 Peter 5:10

And the God of all grace, who called you to his eternal glory in Christ, after you have 
suffered a little while, will himself restore you and make you strong, firm and steadfast. 


2 Peter 1:2 (ESV)

May grace and peace be multiplied to you in the knowledge of God and of Jesus our 
Lord.


2 Peter 3:18

May you grow in the grace and knowledge of our Lord and Savior Jesus Christ. To him 
be glory both now and forever! Amen. 


2 John 1:3

Grace, mercy and peace from God the Father and from Jesus Christ, the Father's Son, 
will be with us in truth and love.


Jude 1:2

Mercy, peace and love be yours in abundance. 


Jude 24-25

To him who is able to keep you from falling and to present you before his glorious 
presence without fault and with great joy-- 25 to the only God our Savior be glory, 
majesty, power and authority, through Jesus Christ our Lord, before all ages, now and 
forevermore! Amen.




Revelation 1:4-6

Grace and peace to you from him who is, and who was, and who is to come, and from 
the seven spirits before his throne, 5 and from Jesus Christ, who is the faithful witness, 
the firstborn from the dead, and the ruler of the kings of the earth who loves us and has 
freed us from our sins by his blood 6 and has made us to be a kingdom and priests to 
serve his God and Father-- to him be glory and power for ever and ever! Amen.


Revelation 5:12–13

“Worthy is the Lamb, who was slain, to receive power and wealth and wisdom and 
strength and honor and glory and praise!” 13“To him who sits on the throne and to the 
Lamb be praise and honor and glory and power, for ever and ever!” 


Revelation 7:12

“Amen! Praise and glory and wisdom and thanks and honor and power and strength be 
to our God for ever and ever. Amen!” 


Revelation 22:21

The grace of the Lord Jesus be with God’s people. Amen. 



